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Ih nlll!h UIII} llulI\!innlly .
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I. Introduction

The Indian mo nsoo n rainfall s ho ws large
intera nnua l a nd uu ra-seascnal variability, which
has well pub licised effec t on the Ind ian economy.
For the purpose of a gricultu ra l plann ing. therefore .
the forecasts of wea ther o n medi um range scale (4·
10 days) are very important.

Th e forecast s on medium ra nge sca le involve
prcdiction of not o nly the in tensi ty and movement
of the curre nt weather sySIC l1lS (i.e.. weather sys tems
observed o n the synoptic chart) but even the growth
and movement of the seco nd genera tion sys tems.
Success in pr ed ict ion of weather by the numerical
meth ods has been limi ted to 2-.1 days in the tropics.
The refore empirica l techniques have been deve­
loped hy many sc ien tists for prediction of rainfall
on 5-day sca le. These techniques include th c effect
of persistence . sys tema tic evolution a nd o ther
physical factors implici tly. They. au toma tica lly,
include the effec t o f the geog raph ical facto rs. A
rather <impIe tech niq ue is that of ana logues. which
has been emp loye d hy severa l researchers and
opera tiona l meteo rologists. This technique is
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simple hu t requires large data sets . We are examin­
ing here the skills of this analogue method in
forecasting 5·day rainfall. The basic principles
involved in ana logue prediction are described in
section 2 and the data used in section 3.The method
followed is illustrated in section 4 and the results
have been presented in sectio n 5. Section 6 assesses
the predictive value of the self-analogue technique .
Th e techn ique is applied for 'recent co ntrasting
monsoon years 1987. a drought year and 1988 and
1990. the good monsoon years. Finally in section 7.
important conclusions are given.

2. Principles Ind use of lhe Inllogu< meth od

The word a nalogue refers 10 two meteorological
stales resembling closely. The assumption involved
in analogue prediction is thai similar initial
situations evolve similarly and give rise to similar
weather, The dynamic solution of the initial state
weather co ndition is implicit in analogue predic­
tion. The method depends on how the nature itself
has integrated its initial states in the historical
records. A major difficulty is that the identical
situations seldom occur and similar situ a tions












